JAMAICA GAZETTE
SUPPLEMENT

PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS
1724

Vol, CX1LIV THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 18, 2021 No. 10A

No.11A
THE PHARMACY ACT

THE PHARMACY (AMENDMENT) (REGULATIONS), 2021

In exercise of the power conferred upon the Council by section 25 of the Pharmacy Act, and
of every other power hereunto enabling, the following Regulations are hereby made:—

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Pharmacy (Amendment) Regulations, 2021,
and shall be read and construed as one with the Pharmacy Regulations, 1975 (hereinafter
referred to as the “principal Regulations™) and all amendments thereto.

2. Regulation 4 of the principal Regulations is amended—

(a) in paragraph (4) by deleting the words “five thousand dollars” wherever they
appear and substituting therefor, in each case, the words “six thousand five
hundred dollars”.



1728 PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS [FEB. 18,2021

(b) in paragraph (5B) by deleting the words “Form H” and substituting therefor E
the words “Form CI”, ' '

3 Regulation 4A of the principal Regulations is amended in paragraph (4) by deleting
the words “Form C1-" and substituting therefor the words “Form H”.
4, Regulation 5 of the principal Regulations is amended—
(8 by deleting paragraph (3) and substituting therefor the following—
“ (3) There shall be paid, by an applicant, in respect of every registration
(or renewal thereof) of a shop—

(8) as a commercial or retail pharmacy, a fee of ten thousand
dollars;

(b) as a manufacturing pharmacy, a fee of fifteen thousand
doliars; : ‘

(c) as a distribution or wholesale pharmacy, a fee of '_-forty :
thousand dollars;

(d) as a professional pharmacy, a fee of eight thousand ddllars,
upon the applicant being notified that his application has -
been successful”; '

(b) in paragraph (4) by deleting the words “two thousand five hundred dollars™
and substituting therefor the words, “five thousand dollars”; ‘ '

(©) in paragraph (5) by deleting the words “fifteen thousand dollars and :
substituting therefor the words “twenty thousand dollars™; ‘

(d) in subparagraph (6)(b) by deleting the words “five hundred dollars” and
substituting therefor the words “two thousand five hundred dollars”.

5. Regulation 20 of the principal Regulations is amended in paragraph (4) by deleting
the words “thirty-six hours” and substituting therefor the words “one hundred and twenty
hours”. ‘

6. Regulation 26 of the principal Regulations is amended—

(a) in paragraph (4) by deleting the words “two thousand five hundred” and
substituting therefor the words “five thousand dollars,”; ' . .

(b)  in paragraph (5) by deleting the words “five hundred dollars” and substituting
therefor the words “two thousand five hundred dollars”.




FEB. 18,2021] PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS 172c

7. The First Schedule to the principal Regulations is amended, in Form Cl by deleting
from the first column the words “Regisiration Fee 5,000.00” and substituting therefor the
words “Registration Fee $6,500.00™.

Dated this 18th day of February, 2021.

DR. EUGENIE BROWN-MYRIE
Chairman
Pharmacy Council.

DR. CHRISTOPHER TUFTON
Minister of Health and Wellness.

PRINTED BY JAMAICA PRINTING SERVICES (1882) LTD., (GOVERNMENT PRINTERS), DUKE STREET, KINGSTON, JAMAICA




